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4. A Bite to 
Eat 

Cavities

It’s a holiday in Zoolandia and 
Tamara and her mother are ta-
king a walk together. 

As soon as Tamara takes a bite of 
ice cream, her teeth start to hurt!

Her mom decides to take her to 
see Croco Doc.

After only a few seconds, Croco 
Doc sees that she has cavities.

No wonder her teeth hurt so 
much!

After a lot of begging, Tamara 
finally gets what she wants...

Pistachio ice cream!

Croco Doc tells Tamara that he’s 
going to use some special tools to 
examine her teeth.

This will help him find out why 
her teeth hurt.

He has to put Tamara’s mouth to 
sleep with some anesthesia.

The needle looks scary, but it 
doesn’t hurt at all!
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Croco Doc removes the cavaties 
and puts fillings.

The fillings fill the holes where 
the cavities used to be.

Croco Doc then explains that ca-
vities are caused by tiny bacteria. 

These bacteria attack the tooth 
enamel.

He gives Tamara some tips on 
how to properly brush her teeth.

Hopefully she won’t get any cavi-
ties again!

When Tamara gets home she 
brushes her teeth for a very long 
time.

She doesn’t want to get any more 
cavaties!
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A few days later, Tamara and her 
mother run into Croco Doc and 
Crat in town. Tamara is enjoying 
some pistachio ice cream, when 
suddenly, Crat takes it away from 
her!

He tells Tamara that she 
shouldn’t eat ice cream if she 
doesn’t want to get cavities.

He actually just wants the ice 
cream all for himself!
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